Republic of the Philippines
Department of Science and Technology
PHILIPPINE SCIENCE HIGH SCHOOL -CENTRAL MINDANAO CAMPUS
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAC)
Nangka, Balo-i, Lanao del Norte
Telephone No. (063) 836-0098
www.cmc.pshs.edu.ph

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Failure of Bidding to Several
Items & Recommending Approval

PSHS-CMC BAC Office
July 17, 2017
10:00 A.M.

Resolution No. 2017-07-05

3

WHEREAS, the Philippine Science High School — Central Mindanao Campus advertised the
Invitation to Bid for the Supply, Delivery and Commissioning of Laboratory Tools and
Equipment Equipment in PhilGEPS website, CMC website and a conspicuous place at the

premises of PSHS-CMC continuously for 7 days;

WHEREAS, the budget for the Supply, Delivery and Commissioning of Laboratory Tools and

Equipment is included in the CY 2017 General Appropriations Act (RA 10924);

WHEREAS, the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) is One Million Nine Hundred Fifty

Thousand Pesos &00/100 (PhP 1,950,000.00);

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisements, there were four (4) suppliers who

submitted letters of intent and purchased bid documents;

WHEREAS, in the scheduled Pre-Bid Conference on June 15, 2017 @ 9:00AM there were

two (2) suppliers attended the said conference;

WHEREAS, on the bid submission deadline at 9AM on June 27, 2017, four (2) bids were

received;

WHEREAS, the result of bid opening starting 9:01AM on the same date is as follows;

Ite % % %
KRYPTON % < ELMAR 5 YANA <
No. | Items/ Description | INDUSTRIAL | Variance | 'ROTRODE | Vawance | yaperin | Yariance | cygmoprrr | Variance
N RESOURCES from ABC & ° ABC G ES

i 90,000.00 -10.00% | 46,350.00 | -53.7% |  68,750.00 -31.3% 78,600.00 -21.4%
Fumehood

2 185,000.00 -38.3% 155,000.00 -48.3% 247,168.00 17.6% 260,000.00 -13.3%
Laboratory Muffle

Non- Non-

3 Furnace 150,000.00 -50.0% Compliance Compli 278,800.00 -71%
Organic Distillation Kit _ N

4 No Bid No Bid Compliance 39,000.00 43.1%
Moto-Saw Tool Set

4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rotary Tool Set

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Drill Press

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Arduino Intermediate N

7 Kit No Bid No Bid No Bid Compliance
Arduino Compatible

8 Sensor and Shields No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAD Plotter/Printer

9 No Bid No Bid No Bid 83,680.00 -16.3%
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WHEREAS, the detailed evaluation of bids conducted on June 27, 2017 at 10AM resuited in

the following:
Ite % % % %
m Items/ x:::::::uu Variance | LABTRADE | Variance MAE;:EA'!'}!N Variance | ol | Variance RE'::EI)SS;LIND
No. Description RESOURCES fAl';lél RS, INC. from ABC G from ABC TIES from ABC ATION
General Award to
1 Purpose Warer 90,000.00 -10.00% 46,350.00 -53.7% 68,750.00 -31.3% 78,600.00 -21.4% Labtraders,
Bath Inc.
Fumehood Award to
2 185,000.00 -38.3% 155,000.00 -48.3% 247,168.00 -17.6% 260,000.00 -13.3% Labtraders,
Inc.
Laboratory Award to
Muffie Furnace y Non- Non- Krypton
3 150,000.00 50.0% Compliance Compliance 278,800.00 -7.1% Industrial
Resources
Organic
Lo . Non- Award to Yana
4 Distillation Kit No Bid No Bid Compiance 39,000.00 43.1% Ct jities
Moto-Saw Tool
4 Set No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Failed Bid
Rotary Tool Set
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Failed Bid
Drill Press
6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Failed Bid
Arduino Non-
7 f(r::ermedlate No Bid No Bid No Bid Compliance Failed Bid
Arduino
Compatible R R . . y
8 Sensor and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Failed Bid
Shields
CAD Award to Yana
9 Plotter/Printer No Bid No Bid No Bid 83,680.00 -16.3% Chemodities

WHEREAS, upon post-qualification and careful examination, validation and verification of
ali the eligibility, technical and financial requirements submitted by the Bidders with the
Lowest Calculated Bid, KRYPTON INDUSTRIAL RESOURCES, INC., LABTRADERS, INC. and YANA
CHEMODITIES, INC its bidS have been found to be responsive to all the requirements;

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE as it is hereby RESOLVED:

a)

b)

<)

d)

e)

KRYPTON INDUSTRIAL RESOURCES, INC. as a Bidder with the Lowest
Calculated and Responsive Bid for the Supply, Delivery and
Commissioning of Laboratory Tools and Equipment Equipment
(Item 3 only) in the amount of ONE HUNDRED FIFTY THOUSAND
PESOS & 00/100 ONLY (PhP 150,000.00);

LABTRADERS, INC. as a Bidder with the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for the Supply, Delivery and Commissioning of
Laboratory Tools and Equipment Equipment (Items 1 and 2 only) in
the amount of TWO HUNDRED ONE THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED
FIFTY PESOS & 00/100 ONLY (PhP 201,350.00);

YANA CHEMODITIES, INC, as a Bidder with the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for the Supply, Delivery and Commissioning of
Laboratory Tools and Equipment Equipment (Items 4 and 9 only) in
the amount of ONE HUNDRED TWENTY THREE THOUSAND FOUR
HUNDRED EIGTHY PESOS & 00/100 ONLY (PhP 123,480.00);
Failure of Bidding for Items No. 4, 5, 6, 7, and 8, re-bidding as a next
mode of procurement;

To recommend for approval by the proper authority of the PSHS Central
Mindanao Campus for the foregoing findings.
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RESOLVED, at the PSHS-CMC Bac Office, this 17™ day of JuLY, 2017.

/‘
ENGR RACHEL P. fIACAMAY

ELEm. MARMES

BAC Member
o Sammal  VAeaTe~ o RN BUSINgS
ENGR. RONIE C. IMPUESTO JASMIN C. ESPERANTE
BAC Member BAC Member/End User

Approved by:

aral«s

LORVI B. PAGOROGON, RPAE, MHWQ
Campus Director
Approved on:
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